



SFPD Q3 and Q4 2022 “Sparks” Policy Quarterly Report to the Police Commission July 1, 2022, through December 31, 2022



SUBMITTED TO THE POLICE COMMISSION ON January 27, 2023

Pursuant to Police Commission Resolution No. 27-06, the department shall provide the Police Commission, on a quarterly basis, a report relating to policy recommendations, proposals, and changes that occurred over the past three months. The report provides the quarterly progress on topics and policies listed accordingly.

SAN FRANCISCO POLICE DEPARTMENT (SFPD)				
	Department General Order Activity	Date	Status	Priority Assessment
1	DGO 3.01 Department Written Directives	7/13/22	Adopted by the commission	High
2	DGO 10.07 + 10.08 Use of Electronic Resources	8/8/22	Executive Sponsor received a draft	Medium
3	DGO 8.02 Hostage and Barricaded Suspect	8/18/22	Adopted by Commission.	High
4	DGO 2.02 Alcohol Use by Members	8/23/22	Approved DGO drafts to be scheduled for simultaneous concurrence	Medium
5	DGO 2.03 Drug Use by Members	8/23/22	Approved DGO drafts to be scheduled for simultaneous concurrence	Medium
6	DGO 3.07 Police Department Collision Board of Review	9/14/22	Adopted by commission	High
7	DGO 2.07 Discipline Process for Sworn Officers	9/15/22	Approved DGO drafts to be scheduled for simultaneous concurrence	Medium
8	DGO 2.06 Vehicle Collisions Involving Members	9/30/22	Draft presented at simultaneous concurrence and returned to SME	Medium
9	DGO 2.08 Peace Officer’s Rights	10/5/22	Meet & confer	High
10	DGO 305 Weapon Return Panel	10/6/22	Drafts approved by SFPD Executive Sponsor and DPA.	Medium
11	DGO 8.01 Critical Incident Evaluation and Notification	10/12/22	Meet & confer as of 10/12/22.	High



SFPD Q3 and Q4 2022 “Sparks” Policy Quarterly Report to the Police Commission July 1, 2022, through December 31, 2022



12	DGO 8.09 Media Relations	10/20/22	Commissioner Yanez separated this from DGO 2.09 Personal Use of social media	Medium
13	DGO 6.09 Domestic Violence	10/22/22	Policy published	High
14	DGO 9.06 Vehicle Tows	10/25/22	DPA & SFPD agree to hold pending completion of DGO 9.01	Medium
15	DGO 10.02, 10.04, 10.05 Equipment	10/26/22	Concurrence draft received	Medium
16	DGO 1.03, 1.04, 1.05 Duties of Station Personnel	10/27/22	Assigned to SME- due to WDU on 02/27/2023	High
17	DGO 6.18 Warrant Arrests	10/31/22	SME submitted a draft to Executive Sponsor	Medium
18	DGO 1.06+1.07 Duties of Superior Officers and Command Officers	11/1/22	Internal draft reviewed. Sent to DPA 1/25/203	Medium
19	DGO 3.12 Department Training Plan	11/1/22	Pending Public posting on the SFPD website	Medium
20	DGO 9.02 Vehicle Accidents	11/1/22	Approved DGO drafts to be scheduled for simultaneous concurrence	Medium
21	DGO 3.10 Serious Incident Review Board	11/14/22	Assigned to SME as WG DGO	High
22	DGO 8.04 Critical Incident Response Team	11/14/22	Pending public posting SFPD website	High
23	DGO 10.11 Body-Worn Cameras	11/30/22	Responded to DPA recommendations	High
24	DGO 3.19 Early Intervention System	12/1/22	Assigned to working group.	High
25	DGO 7.04 Children of Arrested Parents	12/1/22	Pending 30-day public posting ahead of concurrence.	High
26	DGO 1.01 Organizational Structure	12/5/22	Internal draft reviewed. Sent to DPA January 2023	Medium
27	DGO 5.08 Non-Uniformed Officers	12/5/22	DC O’Sullivan discussed with CoP	High
28	DGO 7.03 Sex Offenders	12/5/22	Approved DGO drafts to be scheduled for simultaneous concurrence	Medium



**SFPD Q3 and Q4 2022 “Sparks” Policy
Quarterly Report to the Police Commission
July 1, 2022, through December 31, 2022**



29	DGO 2.01 General Rules of Conduct	12/7/22	Meet & confer	High
30	DGO 5.01 Use of Force	12/8/22	Adopted by Commission	High
31	DGO 3.17 Department Identification Cards	12/14/22	Adopted by Commission	Medium
32	DGO 10.09 Computer Management Committee	12/14/22	Rescinded	Medium
33	DGO 3.13 Field Training Program	12/15/22	Submitted to Police Commission	High
34	DGO 5.06 Citation Release	12/15/22	Completed Draft	High
35	DGO 6.02 Crime Scene & Physical Evidence	12/19/22	Approved DGO drafts to be scheduled for simultaneous concurrence	Medium
36	DGO 11.08 Grooming Standards	12/20/22	Meet & confer	High
37	DGO 3.18 Performance Improvement Plan	12/29/22	Assigned to Commissioner Yanez	Medium
38	DGO 6.12 Arrests of Persons on Parole or Probation	11/18/23	DPA sent a letter to Pres. Elias requesting to move forward with DPA’s Probation/Parole DGO.	High
NEW GENERAL ORDERS				
ORIGINATED BY SFPD				
1	DGO 5.24 Disengagement Policy	10/19/2022	Approved by Police Commission to advance to meet and confer	High
2	DGO x.xx Police Data	08/20/22	Draft received by WDU	Medium



**SFPD Q3 and Q4 2022 “Sparks” Policy
Quarterly Report to the Police Commission
July 1, 2022, through December 31, 2022**



DGO PROPOSALS BY THE DEPARTMENT OF POLICE ACCOUNTABILITY (DPA) TO THE POLICE COMMISSION

1	Foot Pursuits	10/3/2022	C.O.P./SFPD meetings with DPA ON 1/9/2023	Low
---	---------------	-----------	---	-----

PRIORITY KEY		
High	Urgent and important	Legal mandate/ Exigency Criteria met/ Update mandated per Police Commission approved “Annual Review List”.
Medium	Important but not urgent	Not listed in the current “Annual Review List”. This DGO can be scheduled for completion next year and will be included on the 2023 “Annual Review List” which requires Police Commission approval.
Low	Not feasible or warranted	Requires further analysis. Will include a status update in the next quarterly report.

DEPARTMENT BULLETINS WITHIN 120 DAYS OF EXPIRATION

Department Bulletin Name	Date of Expiration	Re-Issue, Rescind, or Incorporating into DGO
--------------------------	--------------------	--



SFPD Q3 and Q4 2022 “Sparks” Policy Quarterly Report to the Police Commission July 1, 2022, through December 31, 2022



1	DB 20-133 Legislative Update 2020	09/21/22	Will not be re-issued; laws are in place; one-time communication.
2	DB 20-175 Activation of Body-Worn Cameras	12/03/22	Incorporating into DGO

DEPARTMENT WORKING GROUP UPDATE

While not required by Police Commission Resolution 27-06, the following is SFPD’s SMB tracking of Department lead working groups. This track working group activity between July – December 2022 (Q3 & Q4)

DGO Working Group		Executive Sponsor	Q3 meeting dates	Q4 meeting dates	Status
1	DGO 7.01 Policies & Procedures for Juvenile Detention, Arrest, and Custody	DC Robert O’Sullivan Designee: Commander Moran	No meetings	10/25/22 12/15/22	Active
2	DGO 9.07 Curtailing the Use of Pretextual Stops	Commission Working Group	8/2/22, 8/25/22	10/6/22, 10/20/22	DGO in meet and confer